City of Kirksville, Missouri
2014 Bid Tabulation

Bid Item: Fire Hydrants & Fittings City Department: Public Works
Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder
HD Waterworks Blue Springs
Water & Sewer Supply Winwater Schulte Supply
Description Quantity [ Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
5Y4" Fire Hydrants w/4' Bury 18 $1,398.31 $25,169.58| $1,415.00 $25,470.00| $1,375.25 $24,754.50f NO BID $0.00
5Y4" Fire Hydrants w/4%2' Bury 4 $1,444.09 $5,776.36| $1,450.00 $5,800.00( $1,407.00 $5,628.00 NO BID $0.00
5Y4" Fire Hydrants w/5' Bury 4 $1,476.34 $5,905.36| $1,483.00 $5,932.00( $1,439.00 $5,756.00f NO BID $0.00
5Y4" Fire Hydrants w/5%2' Bury 4 $1,508.59 $6,034.36| $1,540.00 $6,160.00( $1,471.00 $5,884.00f NO BID $0.00
5Y4" Fire Hydrants w/6' Bury 2 $1,540.85 $3,081.70( $1,572.00 $3,144.00 $1,505.00 $3,010.00f NOBID $0.00
Traffic Repair Kits 10 $0.00 $0.00| $172.00 $1,720.00 $96.00 $960.00 NOBID $0.00
6" MJ Valves w/Accs. 75 $429.63 $32,222.25| $395.00 $29,625.00] $423.50 $31,762.50] $427.86 $32,089.50
5Y4" x 16" Valve Box Top 85 $42.44 $3,607.40 $42.89 $3,645.65 $43.35 $3,684.75 $42.29 $3,594.65
5Y4" x 26" Valve Box Top 85 $65.64 $5,579.40 $66.34 $5,638.90 $66.35 $5,639.75 $65.39 $5,558.15
5Y4" Lid Marked "Water" 50 $11.28 $564.00 $11.39 $569.50 $10.75 $537.50 $11.28 $564.00
Total Bid Proposal $87,940.41 $87,705.05 $87,617.00 $41,806.30
Recommended Bidder: Blue Springs Winwater Bid Price: $87,617.00

Bid Opening Date & Time: Council Chambers

Bids Opened By:

01/14/2014 @ 3:00 pm Opening Location:

Vickie Brumbaugh, City Clerk Witnessed By: Billie Linhart, PW Secretary

Bid Information On File At: City Clerk's Office How Advertised: Bidders List & Internet



